BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Madison County, Mississippi

E-911 Administration Office 146 W. Center Street, Room 203, PO Box 608, Canton, MS 39046
T: (601) 859-6485 F: (601) 859-4743

DATE: June 25, 2013
TO: Madison County Board of Supervisors
FROM: Butch Hammack d/
Emergency Management Office m \ (\,\
RE: Road Claim Q\gﬁ

Shoney Anderson-Harris

After further investigation on the above referenced claim, it is the recommendation of the .

Emergency Management Office to approve and pay the claim to the order of Shoney
Anderson- Harris in the amount of $700.00 (the lesser of the two attached quotes) for stated
repairs. If any further information is needed, please contact our office.

The road was not repaired within 7 days allowed by Road Damage Policy.



ROAD CLAIM INCIDENT REPORT

' Inorder to process claim, please print & fill out completely, then return to Madison County Road Dept. or
Madison Co. EMA office along with two signed estimates for damages being claimed.

Personal

Date: v/(/ e '7 e
Information Name:Jg und_Arclessun- Harrvs
Mailing Address:

002 Kathering Drive
Contin MS 3404k
Contact #: ((ﬁO l\OL{O 13349
Make/ Model of Vehicle: CJ’\P \[\ll —‘?C(l’[ h\C&ZPI‘ (Ob D‘K—Dq |

Incident Please answer questions below in relations to the incident being

reported:

Date: /VH < Z) 2013 Time: 53\’50
Location: %\C K% ’\DY \|€,

(name of road incident occurred)
Area Landmarks: C 1ot To A of C}CM_FG& Church
Approx. Speed at time of incident: s Im Dh

Direction of Travel: | QU (A5 /P\GQQ%S Paric
Cause of Incident: Sﬁ el PM:?)\ s

(ie: pothole rock, etc..)
it

Information

Area of vehicle damagedi
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Date Received: Received by: jE:‘/ Dept: CI/VV\A’ '
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g e tmm:
L S O i CANTON TIRE & SERVICE, LLC

1206 West Peace Street
Canton, MS 39046

| ” 601-855-2525 Fax 601-855-2523 Cell 769-798-08
© | CUSTOMER’S ORDER NO. PHONE DATE

NAME

ADDRESS

YEAR MAKE MODEL VIN:

MILEAGE

DESCRIPTION
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All claims and returned goods must be accompanied by this bill. THANK YC



l \ Office of the Sheriff
' ﬁ ' Madison Coung, Mississippi

2941 Highway 5] ® Canton, Mississippi 39046
Randall Tucker, Sheriff

James Cannon
Deputy Sheriff SO-26

Casenogd O] 5= Cell:
Office: (601) 859-2345 Toll Free: 1-877-736-2883
Jackson: (601) 355-0379

Fax: (601) 859-6764






Jennifer Taylor

From: Jennifer Taylor <jennifer.taylor@madison-co.com>
Sent: Monday, June 10, 2013 2:28 PM

To: Hellen Keller (hkeller@madison-co.com)

Subject: Road Claim Report

Helen,

We received a damage claim late Friday evening for Ricks Dr. She sent pictures of 3 potholes and the
landmark was given “close to Ark of Safety Church “. Our seven day window will be the 18". Please let me
know when holes are repaired.

Thank you and have a great day!

enwnlifer Carpenter

Administrative Assistant

Madison County Board of Supervisors
Emergency Management Office

0: 601-855-5620

C: 601-259-2260



Jennifer Taylor

From: Helen Keller <hkeller@madison-co.com>
Sent: Tuesday, June 18, 2013 10:41 AM

To: Jennifer Taylor

Subject: RE: Ricks Dr

No, it is not done.

From: Jennifer Taylor [mailto:jennifer.taylor@madison-co.com]
Sent: Tuesday, June 18, 2013 9:50 AM

To: Helen Keller

Subject: Ricks Dr

Have the repairs been made to Ricks Dr. yet? The 7 day period for our claim is today? I did receive a call
this morning about someone else hitting a pothole on Ricks Dr. last night. Please advise so I can proceed
with claim process.

Thanks and have a good one!

_ennifer Carpenter

Administrative Assistant

Madison County Board of Supervisors
Emergency Management Office

0: 601-855-5620

C: 601-259-2260



